



	FREEDOM OF INFORMATION REQUESTS AND RESPONSES  
2024
Essex Police Fire and Crime Commissioner’s Office


	
001
	12.01.24
	
Information relating to the costs of Equality and Diversity Training within the in the 2022 Financial Year. 

	No training costs were incurred during 01 July – 31 December 2023 for E&D Training.No official EDI Events were held by Civil Servants in the PFCC’s Office from 01 July – 31 December 2023.  

	

002
	29.01.24
	
Details of any victims’ services commissioned by the OPCC exclusively or included for victims under the age of 18 for the year 2022/23 and 2021/22. 

	Copy of response available from Police Fire and Crime Commissioner’s Office -  PFCC@essex.police.uk


	

003
	13.02.24
	
Any recorded information regarding the PFCC's role in supervising, monitoring and setting priorities for Essex Police for calendar years 2022 and 2023 on their access to information role: Data subject access requests, Requests for information about third parties, FOI requests.

	This information is available on our website:  www.essex.pfcc.police.uk via PCP and P&R board minutes

	

004
	26.02.24
	
A copy of your most recent Executive Summary/Evaluation of your Perpetrator Programme(s) funded fully or in part by the Home Office Perpetrator Fund.

	
This information is available on our website: www.essex.pfcc.police.uk (DR 55-23)


	

005
	28.02.24
	
Any written communication from 2020-2023 inclusively between PFCC office and Police, regarding veganphobia or hate crime against vegans.

	
There is no written communication from 2020-23 inclusively between the PFCC office and Police, regarding veganphobia or hate crime against vegans. 


	006
	01.03.24
	information regarding your secure communication.
	
This information is not held by the Police, Fire and Crime Commissioner’s Office – forwarded to Essex Police to provide response.


	

007
	29.02.24
	
Alleged offences reported but no action taken (999, 101, online) Guidance/instructions given to FCR, DCs on dealing with reported drug offences. In current and previous year how many 999 calls alleging drug dealing received? How many from Uttlesford residents?

	

This information is not held by the Police, Fire and Crime Commissioner’s Office – forwarded to Essex Police to provide response.

	

008
	28.03.24
	
Information relating to the VRU programme and Theory of Change or Logic Mode including commissioning and evaluation.  Please provide a copy of the ToCh and/or detailed LM or a link to where the ToCh is published.

	
Copy of response available from Police Fire and Crime Commissioner’s Office -  PFCC@essex.police.uk


	


009
	10.04.24
	
What are the physical staffing levels of Police Offices (by rank please), PCSOs, and Police Staff this year compared against the last two years?
What are the physical staffing levels of the Essex PCC and its administration this year compared against the last two years?  
What is the availability rate of the PCSOs Frinton and Walton Council pay Essex Police to supply to the area?

	
Copy of response available from Police Fire and Crime Commissioner’s Office -  PFCC@essex.police.uk


	


010  
	18.04.24
	
Information request on spend and contract for office supplies and associated products for 1st Apr 2022 – 31st Mar 2023, 1st Apr 2023 – 31st Mar 2024 including enquiries on contract duration, extension and decision. Request website link for published register of contracts and purchasing. 

	
Copy of response available from Police Fire and Crime Commissioner’s Office -  PFCC@essex.police.uk


	




012 
	19.05.24
	
Request for information for Domestic Abuse Perpetrator Programme for the 2022/2023 Financial Year.  Details of the commissioned programme including programmes designed for male victims that accept/engage/support females. The total number of females who self-referred into the programme, the total number of self-referred females who were accepted and who have completed the programme. The total number of females referred by an agency into the programme, 
who were accepted and who have completed the programme. The names of the organisations who made a referral to the programme.

	
Copy of response available from Police Fire and Crime Commissioner’s Office -  PFCC@essex.police.uk


	



014
	23.05.24
	
Can you provide details of grants (including the amount, the service provider, the services provided and the specific stalking outcome/output) awarded in the financial years 2022-2023 and 2023-2024 for which at least one of the outputs/outcomes was to provide services to victims of stalking. Please indicate with a y/n if the service is open to victims of stalking who are not ex-intimate in the table below. 

	
Copy of response available from Police Fire and Crime Commissioner’s Office -  PFCC@essex.police.uk


	
015
	19.06.24
	Enquiry regarding a member of Essex Police 
	
Refusal Notice under Section 40 (2) FOI Act 2000  


	[bookmark: _Hlk187220484]


016
	21.06.24
	
For the tax years 2014/15 to2022/23 inclusive, (1) how much revenue has been received by your organisation for services rendered to film and tv productions? (2) Please outline the type of work or service rendered and the revenue received and (3) cost to your organisation on facilitating arrangements.


	

1. zero 
2. zero
3. zero

	[bookmark: _Hlk187220505]

017
	06.07.24
	
Request information referring to blue light attendance recording in the period January - June 2024
a) Police   b) Ambulances
at (A)Wethersfield Asylum Centre and (B) HMP Chelmsford

	

This information is not held by the Police, Fire and Crime Commissioner’s Office – forwarded to Essex Police to provide response.

	

019
	07.08.24
	Requesting information on deployment of appliance from South Woodham fire station to a recent house fire 
	
This information is not held by the Police, Fire and Crime Commissioner’s Office – forwarded to Essex County Fire and Rescue Service to provide response.


	
021
	20.09.24
	
Requesting information on Riot Compensation Act claims between 30 July - 19 Sept 24

	
This information is not held by the Police, Fire and Crime Commissioner’s Office – forwarded to Essex Police to provide response.


	

022
	23.09.24
	
1. Number of 1:1 meetings with PFCC and members of the public between Jan-Dec 2023
2. Pieces of correspondence received and completed in the PFCC office that require investigations

	
Copy of response available from Police Fire and Crime Commissioner’s Office -  PFCC@essex.police.uk


	

023
	25.09.24
	
Requesting breakdown of officer allocation across the county, per district and per specialist division such as traffic, rural crime etc.

	
Information regarding police officer numbers is publicly available and can be found on the Police Fire and Crime Commissioner’s website: www.essex.pfcc.police.uk


	

024
	21.10.24
	
Request for information on framework agreements for call-off contracts: (a) Award Notice for motorcycle storage relocation at Essex Police and (b)  Harlow Police Station Rest Area & Locker Room Refurbishment awarded by the PFCC 

	  
(a) Procurement reference: CF-0010000D4K000001WteKUAS:
     ECC Construction Framework 2 (ECF2)   Lot 1A
(b) Procurement reference: CF-0012300D4K000001WteKUAS:
     ECC Construction Framework 2 (ECF2) Lot 1A







